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Reactive Oxygen Species, Redox Signaling and Neuroinflammation in 
Alzheimer's Disease: The NF-κB Connection 
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Abstract: Oxidative stress and inflammatory response are important elements of Alzheimer's disease 
(AD) pathogenesis, but the role of redox signaling cascade and its cross-talk with inflammatory mediators 
have not been elucidated in details in this disorder. The review summarizes the facts about redox-signaling 
cascade in the cells operating through an array of kinases, phosphatases and transcription factors and their downstream 
components. The biology of NF-κB and its activation by reactive oxygen species (ROS) and proinflammatory cytokines in 
the pathogenesis of AD have been specially highlighted citing evidence both from post-mortem studies in AD brain and 
experimental research in animal or cell-based models of AD. The possibility of identifying new disease-modifying drugs 
for AD targeting NF-κBsignaling cascade has been discussed in the end.  

Keywords: Alzheimer’s disease, amyloid beta, cytokines, NF-κB, oxidative stress, redox signaling. 

INTRODUCTION 

Oxidative stress as a major driving force in the patho-
genesis of Alzheimer's disease (AD) has been generally ac-
cepted because of compelling evidence of accumulation of 
oxidative damage markers of protein, DNA and phospholip-
ids in post-mortem AD brain as well as in the brains of AD 
transgenic animals [1-3]. The redox proteomic data obtained 
from MCI (mild cognitive impairment) and AD post-mortem 
brains have been very convincing in identifying oxidative 
damage to key enzymes and proteins that may play a major 
role in AD pathogenesis [4,5]. The depletion of reduced glu-
tathione, accumulation of redox-active transition metals and 
decrease in the activities of antioxidant enzymes are also 
indicative of a pro-oxidant milieu in AD brain [1-3,6,7]. In 
addition, there is a growing body of information in different 
experimental models indicating the pro-oxidative nature of 
amyloid beta peptide, which amply rationalizes the oxidative 
damage theory of AD pathogenesis [3,8,9]. However, a ma-
jor caveat exists in our understanding of the relationship be-
tween oxidative stress and AD. The role of altered redox 
signaling pathways in AD pathogenesis especially in the 
early phase of the disease has not been explored in details so 
far, but this is an area which not only can reveal the initial 
molecular events of AD pathology, but also may provide 
clues for identifying new drug targets. 
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In the present review, we will provide a brief outline of 
AD highlighting the clinical manifestations, neuropathology, 
pathogenesis, risk factors and available therapy or rather the 
lack of it, and then proceed to describe the importance of 
altered redox signaling in AD pathogenesis focusing on the 
NF-κB pathway and linking it with neuroinflammation. The 
review will also describe some novel approaches for AD 
therapy by interfering with NF-κB signaling. 

ALZHEIMER'S DISEASE: OVERVIEW 

Dementia of the Alzheimer’s type predominantly affects 
the memory and gradually involves the visuospatial and lan-
guage domains; progressing from a preclinical phase to mild 
cognitive impairment and finally to dementia [10-12]. In the 
course of its progression, various neuropsychiatric and be-
havioral abnormalities develop and the disease incapacitates 
the patients with regards to executive functioning [12]. The 
mean duration of the disease process is around 8 years from 
the onset of clinical features to death [13]. 

Recent estimates have revealed that there are more than 
35.6 million people living with dementia worldwide, and this 
is expected to rise to 65.7 million by 2030 with age specific 
prevalence doubling every 5 years after 65 years of age, and 
AD accounts for the majority of such dementia patients [14]. 
By far the commonest type of AD is sporadic AD, and auto-
somal dominance is seen in only about 5% cases of AD (fa-
milial AD). Familial AD usually has an earlier age of onset 
caused by a mutation of any of the 3 genes e.g. Amyloid 
Precursor Protein (APP), Presenilin 1 (PS 1) and Presenilin 2 
(PS 2) [15]. On the other hand, the sporadic form of the dis-
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ease has a complex multi-factorial etiology with aging being 
the most dominant risk factor. Epidemiological studies have 
identified multiple risk factors for sporadic AD that include 
hypertension, head injury, mid-life obesity, hypercholes-
terolemia, hyperhomocysteinemia, type 2 diabetes and Al 
toxicity [14,16]. 

Parts of the brain predominantly affected by AD include 
the hippocampus, enterorhinal cortex, amygdala and differ-
ent areas of neocortex which show severe loss of cholinergic 
neurons. The typical neuropathological features of AD brain 
include extracellular neuritic plaques or some other varieties 
of amyloid plaques and intraneuronal neurofibrillary tangles 
[17,18]. The neuritic plaque consists of a central core of 
deposition of oligomerized amyloid beta peptide (primarily 
Aβ42 and Aβ40) surrounded by degenerating neuronal proc-
esses (dystrophic neurites), while the intraneuronal neurofi-
brillary tangles are composed of paired helical filaments of 
hyperphosphorylated tau proteins [17,18]. This typical neu-
ropathology is associated with diffuse loss of neurons, de-
generation of axons, dendrites and synapses, gliosis and the 
presence of inclusion bodies [17,18]. Several neuropa-
thological staging methods are available including the recent 
recommendations of National Institute on Aging / Alz-
heimer's Association [17,18]. 

The pathogenesis of AD includes interdependent damage 
pathways of oxidative stress, mitochondrial dysfunction, 
calcium dysregulation, ER stress, synaptic dysfunction, mi-
croglial activation and inflammatory response and abnormal 
accumulation and aggregation of amyloid beta peptides 
(Aβ42, Aβ40 etc) or hyperphosphorylated tau [3,19-22]. For 
long it has been held that many of these damage pathways 
operating in the AD brain are the outcome of excessive for-
mation, accumulation and aggregation of Aβ42, and the 
soluble oligomers of Aβ42 primarily trigger these toxic 
events (amyloid cascade hypothesis) [20,21]. Although the 
cause for the excessive production or accumulation of Aβ42 
in AD, especially for the sporadic variety, is not apparent, 
the detailed pathways of formation of these peptides from 
amyloid precursor protein (APP) by sequential proteolysis 
by β-secretase (BACE 1) and γ-secretase have been eluci-
dated [20]. The trafficking of the amyloid beta peptide from 
endoplasmic reticulum through trans-golgi network, secre-
tory vesicles, plasma membrane and endosomes and also the 
degradation of the peptide by neprilysin, insulin degrading 
enzyme (IDE), endothelin converting enzyme - 1 etc. have 
also been worked out in considerable details [20, 23]. 

At present, the drugs approved for AD aim to correct the 
symptoms of cholinergic deficiency or to antagonize gluta-
mate mediated excitotoxicity, but various supporting drugs 
are also used to provide symptomatic relief or to treat the co-
morbidities and the risk factors. The cholinesterase inhibitors 
like donepezil, gallantamine and rivastigmine tend to restore 
the synaptic levels of acetylcholine and are useful in mild to 
moderate cases of AD. Memantine, an NMDA-receptor as-
sociated channel blocker, though effective in moderate to 
severe cases of AD does not have substantial impact on dis-
ease progression. Apart from these four drugs approved by 
FDA, there are many potential disease-modifying agents 
under various phases of clinical trials, but quite a few of 
them, most notably the drugs targeting amyloid beta peptide 

metabolism and clearance, have been rejected in the course 
of the trials [24,25]. The scenario at present is not only dis-
appointing, but also it has raised fundamental questions 
about AD disease models. Nevertheless the novel drug de-
velopment for AD should emphasize on primary mediators 
involved in neurotoxicity. 

ROS AND INFLAMMATION IN AD BRAIN 

The two interdependent mechanisms of AD pathogenesis 
that are relevant in the present review are oxidative stress 
and inflammatory reactions which work in concert in AD 
brain and both impinge on NF-κB pathway. The involvement 
of oxidative damage in AD pathogenesis has been high-
lighted already [1-5]. It will be logical to present a brief out-
line of inflammatory response in AD brain, before returning 
to ROS and redox signaling. Although there are many unan-
swered questions, an enormous body of evidence has linked 
inflammation with AD pathogenesis from studies of post-
mortem AD brains and experimental models of this disease 
[26,27]. Microglial activation by fibrillar or soluble oli-
gomeric amyloid beta and possibly other inducers lead to the 
release of inflammatory cytokines, complement components 
and chemokines such as IL-1β, TNF-α, IL-6, IFN-γ, mono-
cyte chemotactic protein - 1 (MCP-1), macrophage inflam-
matory protein (MIP-1α, MIP-1β) etc., and reactive astro-
cytes also contribute to the process [26-28]. The oligomeric 
and fibrilar forms of amyloid beta also activate the comple-
ment pathway by binding to C1q and C3b in the absence of 
any antibody [26,28]. Various complement fragments and 
the end product of complement activation, membrane attack 
complex (MAC), have been found to accumulate near the 
plaques and over the dystrophic neurites in AD brain 
[26,28]. The activated microglia which express pro-
inflammatory surface markers like CD45, CD40, CD35, 
MHC class II etc. also accumulate in large numbers around 
the neuritic plaques, and elevated levels of various cytokines 
and chemokines are found in AD brain [26-28]. The soluble 
oligomeric or fibrillar forms of amyloid beta bind to micro-
glia via numerous receptors such as the immunoglobulin Fc 
receptor, complement receptor, receptor for advanced glyca-
tion end products (RAGE), serpin receptor complex, scaven-
ger receptor class B type 1, formyl peptide chemotactic re-
ceptor, a complex receptor of CD36/CD47/α6β1integrin etc., 
and can trigger the secretion of cytokines through activation 
of NF-κB [26,29]. The cytokines released by microglial acti-
vation unleash a self-perpetuating cycle of inflammatory 
response and also interact with amyloid β peptide oligomers 
and distressed neurons triggering apoptosis, oxidative dam-
age and excitotoxicity [26-28,30]. Some cytokines also 
upregulate APP expression and facilitate amyloidogenic 
processsing of the protein [26-28,30]. The final outcome of 
this inflammatory response is neuronal and synaptic degen-
eration. However, neuroinflammation in AD may not be 
purely injurious, and alternative activation of microglia in 
AD brain has been evidenced which assists in regeneration 
and repair through cytokines like IL-4, IL-10 and TGFβ 
[26,30]. There are studies which imply that common molecu-
lar pathways stimulated by Aβ42 and inflammatory media-
tors in AD brain cause increased activity of NF-κB. It is not 
certain whether the activation of NF-κB associated with in-
flammatory response in AD aggravates the brain damage or 



448    Current Topics in Medicinal Chemistry, 2015, Vol. 15, No. 5 Kaur et al. 

provides neuroprotection and neuroregeneration because of 
the varied nature of the genes upregulated by NF-kB. In gen-
eral, the activation of glial (inducible) NF-κB causes neu-
ronal death and degeneration while that of neuronal (consitu-
tive) NF-κB provides neuroprotection and plasticity [31,32]. 
The activation of NF-Κb in astrocytes also aggravates the 
proinflammatory response and tissue injry [26]. The duration 
of NF-κB activation, transient or sustained, also determines 
the nature of cellular response in the brain [32]. 

ROS and Redox Signaling 

The multiple sources and complex chemistry of intracel-
lular ROS, the interdependent radical chain reactions damag-
ing proteins, phospholipids and DNA and the attenuation of 
these toxic radical reactions by enzymic and non-enzymic 
antioxidants have been elaborately reviewed by many 
authors and will not be discussed in details here. In short, 
there are mitochondrial and extra-mitochondrial sources of 
ROS consisting of superoxide radicals (O2

.- ), hydrogen per-
oxide, hydroxyl radicals (OH.), nitric oxide (NO) and per-
oxynitrite radical (ONOO-). Some of these radicals react 
among themselves either spontaneously or by metal-
catalyzed and enzyme-catalyzed reactions [3]. The mito-
chondrial source of ROS consists of primarily the respiratory 
chain complex I and complex III and several other enzymes 
like pyruvate dehydrogenase, α-ketoglutarate dehydrogenase, 
aconitase, α-glycerophosphate dehydrogenase and dihydro-
orotate dehydrogenase [33]. The extra-mitochondrial sources 
include the membrane -bound NADPH oxidases, nitric oxide 
synthase, cycloxygenase, lipoxygenase, xanthine oxidase and 
cytochrome P450 dependent enzymes which generate ROS 
as part of normal metabolism or following activation of re-
ceptors by growth factors and cytokines [3]. 

For long the role of ROS in many degenerative diseases 
including AD has been attributed to the direct damaging ef-
fects of these radicals on different biomolecules causing 
structural and functional derangement of cells and organ-
elles. However, there is a paradigm shift in our understand-
ing of ROS involvement in disease mechanisms recently. 
There is accumulating evidence of the involvement of ROS 
in cell signaling pathways or transcriptional activation of 
genes, and more emphasis is, therefore, given on altered re-
dox-signaling in disease mechanisms instead of direct radical 
mediated damage to cell organelles. The modulation of insu-
lin or growth factor or cytokine signaling pathways or the 
activation of the trascription factor NF-κB by H2O2 or other 
oxidants are some of the early but convincing studies in re-
dox signaling mechanisms [34,35,36,37]. In redox signaling, 
ROS (most commonly H2O2 because of its relative stability 
and diffusibility) oxidize reactive thiol groups of key redox-
responsive proteins altering their properties in a fashion 
somewhat similar to activity modulation of enzymes by re-
versible phosphorylation – dephosphorylation (Fig. 1). The 
thiol groups of free cysteines are not reactive having pKa 
values of 8 - 9, but within the special microenvironments of 
some proteins the pKa values of some thiol groups may be 
lowered to 4 - 5 converting these groups to nucleophilic thio-
late anions [38,39]. On reaction with H2O2, thiolates form 
sulfenic acid (SOH) residues, which may be further oxidized 
to sulfinic acid or sulfonic acid groups [38,39]. The SOH 

residues of the proteins may react with other thiol groups of 
the same or different proteins forming intramolecular or in-
termolecular disulfide linkages or amide groups of proteins 
to form sulphenyl amides, or alternatively, these may react 
with thiol residues of glutathione causing S-glutathionylation 
of proteins [38,39,40]. Apart from the modification of pro-
tein thiols by direct oxidation by H2O2, a change in the cellu-
lar redox state e.g. altered ratio of GSSG:GSH (oxidized 
glutathione:reduced glutathione) may lead to increased S-
glutathionylation of proteins [40]. The protein disulfide link-
ages may be reduced by glutaredoxin-reduced glutathione-
glutathione reductase or thioredoxin-thioredoxin reductase 
[38,40,41]. Apart from cysteine oxidation, the redox signal-
ing may entail other kinds of protein modifications such as 
thiol alkylation, histidine oxidation to 2-oxo-histidine, pro-
tein nitrosylation and carbonylation [38,40,41]. Apparently, 
plenty of such redox-sensitive target proteins like phospha-
tases, kinases and other components of cell signaling path-
ways or transcription factors may act as substrates for such 
reversible covalent modifications [38-41]. These protein 
modifications especially protein sulfenylation may change 
the activity status of the proteins [38-41]. Thus, the reversi-
ble protein modificatios of cell signaling components and 
transcription facors by ROS may lead to a wide range of 
cellular responses in various physiological and pathological 
conditions [38-41]. For example, several protein phospha-
tases like tyrosine protein phosphatase 1B (PTP1B), serine-
threonine protein phosphatase 2A (PP2A), dual-specificity 
protein phosphatase (MAP kinase phosphatase1), lipid phos-
phatase (PTEN) act as negative modulators of insulin signal-
ing by dephosphorylating specific down-stream components 
[42]. These phosphatases require specific cysteine residues 
in the reduced form for their activity and are good targets for 
redox regulation [42]. Thus ROS can oxidize the essential 
cysteine residues, inactivate the phosphatases and thereby 
enhance insulin signaling [42]. Similarly, H2O2 generated 
following PDGF binding to receptors (PDGF-R) may inacti-
vate the low-molecular weight protein tyrosine phosphatase 
(LMW-PTP) by inducing disulfide bond formation between 
cys 12 and cys 17, and this phenomenon prevents the 
dephosphorylation of PDGF-R and sustains the activated 
state [34,43]. Likewise, in case of EGF signaling, H2O2 gen-
erated by NOX activation causes inactivation of several 
phosphatases like PTP1B, PTEN and SHP-2 by oxidation of 
specific cysteine residues preventing the dephosphorylation 
of EGF receptor (EGF-R) [43]. Additionally, EGF-R may 
undergo protein sulfenylation at cys 797 by a direct action of 
H2O2 leading to an enhanced receptor tyrosine kinase activity 
[43]. Apart from the modulation of insulin and growth factor 
signaling cascades, redox reactions through cysteine oxida-
tion regulate the activities of many non-receptor protein 
kinases like Akt, PKC, cytosolic Src, p21 ras, ataxia te-
langiectasia mutated (ATM) protein kinase and a set of ser-
ine-threonine kinases comprising of ERK 1/2, JNK and p38 
[39,43,44]. 

The redox-sensitive transcription factors like AP-1, SP1, 
HIF-1, NRF-2, NF-κB, Nrf-2, CREB, p53 etc. constitute a 
large family of proteins which can be activated in a number 
of ways by ROS causing expression changes in a wide vari-
ety of genes regulating growth, survival, differentiation, cy-
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toprotection and apoptosis [38,45,46]. The ROS may either 
cause an increased synthesis of a transcription factor or may 
activate an existing transcription factor. The increased syn-
thesis of the transcription factors by ROS may be brought 
about by increased mRNA stability, activation of MAP 
kinases or increased efficiency of translation [38]. On the 
other hand, ROS may activate an existing transcription factor 
by thwarting its proteasomal degradation or releasing it from 
an inhibitory binding partner or causing post-translational 
modifications leading to nuclear translocation or increasing 
its DNA binding propensity [38,45-50]. For example, Nrf-2 
is localized in cytosol in association with Kelch-like ECH 
associating protein 1(Keap1) which prompts its degradation 
by the proteasome pathway. The ROS oxidize specific cys-
teine residues of Keap1 leading to its dissociation from Nrf-2 
[46]. The release of Nrf-2 from Nrf-2-Keap1 complex is fa-
cilitated by phosphorylation of Nrf-2 by several ROS acti-
vated kinases like PKC and PERK [46]. The released Nrf-2 
translocates to nucleus and heteromerizes with one of the 
small Maf proteins, and the heterodimer binds to an antioxi-
dant responsive element (ARE) present at the regulatory sites 
of different genes [46]. The binding of Nrf-2 heterodimer 
causes transcriptional activation of phase II detoxification 
enzymes, enzymes for glutathione synthesis, heat-shock pro-
teins etc. [46]. In case of hypoxia-inducible factor (HIF), the 
activation occurs in a different way. HIF in the transcription-
ally active form is a dimer of HIF-α and HIF-β. In normoxic 
condition HIF-α is hydroxylated at two proline residues by 
prolyl hydroxylase domain (PHD) enzyme and then rapidly 
degraded by the proteasomal pathway. Under hypoxic condi-
tion or in the presence of ROS or some NO donors, PHD is 
inactivated leading to diminished hydroxylation and conse-
quent stabilization of HIF-α [46]. HIF-α then dimerizes with 
HIF-β, translocates to nucleus, binds to the hypoxia-response 
element in different genes and activates or suppresses the 
process of transcription [46]. 

There are several tricky issues with ROS signaling espe-
cially with specificity of the signaling process for a highly 
diffusible compound like H2O2. Moreover, the members of 
the signaling cascade are usually present in low quantity and 
have lower rate constants for reaction with H2O2 compared 
to a large number of competing antioxidant molecules. These 
issues have been adequately discussed in several reviews, 
but we would not delve further in this problem in the present 
discussion [38,39]. On the contrary, in the context of the 
current discussion we will present, an elaborate description 
of the transcription factor NF-κB highlighting its role in 
coupling ROS signaling and inflammatory mediators in the 
backdrop of Alzheimer's disease and its potential in drug 
development. 

Biology of NF-κB 

Although originally identified in connection with the 
regulation of immunoglobulin synthesis, it is now estab-
lished that NF-κB is present in all kinds of cells controlling 
the transcription of a wide variety of genes under diverse 
physiological and pathological conditions [51,52]. These 
genes include pro-apoptotic and pro-survival genes, pro-
inflammatory cytokines, antioxidant enzymes, pro-oxidant 
enzymes and many others [51,52]. The NF-κB family mem-
bers RelA/p65, RelB, cRel, p52 (derived from the precursor 

p100) and p50 (derived from the precursor p105) are charac-
terized by a Rel homology domain (RHD) of 300 amino ac-
ids, which mediates dimerization as well as DNA binding 
[51,52]. The DNA binding site is a 10-bp stretch of DNA 
with the consensus sequence GGGPuNNPyPyCC [51,53]. 
Apart from the RHD, each of RelA/p65, RelB and cRel also 
contains a carboxy-terminal transactivation domain to 
upregulate gene transcription following DNA binding, and in 
addition RelB also contains a leucine-zipper domain [51,53]. 
The other members of NF-κB family like p50 and p52 do not 
contain any transactivation domain, while their precursors 
p105 and p100 also contain ankyrin repeats and glycine-rich 
regions [51,53]. The proteolytic cleavage of p105 and p100 
occurs at the glycine-rich region in the proteasomal complex 
by a process known as regulated ubiquitin proteasome de-
pendent pathway [53-55]. The members of NF-κB family 
can form homodimers and heterodimers among themselves, 
but RelB forms heterodimers only with p50 or p52 [51,52]. 
Although different combinations of homodimers and het-
erodimers are present in different cells and in different con-
ditions, the most predominant form of NF-κB normally is 
RelA-p50 [51]. All combinations of NF-κB dimers, however, 
cannot upregulate transcription because p50 and p52 do not 
have transactivation domains, but instead homo or heterodi-
mers of p50 and p52 can bind to kB DNA binding site and 
prevent the binding of a transcriptionally active dimer like 
RelA-p50 [51,53,56]. However, the availability of different 
types of dimers probably indicates that the dimers may bind 
to different kB DNA binding sites of a wide variety of genes 
with different affinities regulating their functions. 
 

  
Fig. (1). Redox dependent sulfenylation of proteins lead to activa-
tion /deactivation of kinases, phosphatases and transcription factors. 
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Normally NF-κβ dimers remain cytosolic and in inactive 
state in resting cells by interaction with IkB, but is induced 
to active form by a bewildering set of stimuli. Bacteria or 
bacterial products (lipopolysaccharide or LPS), viruses or 
viral products (double-stranded RNA, TAT, gp160 etc.), 
cytokines and chemokines, growth factors, UV radiation, 
oxidative stress, receptor ligands (CD 4 ligand, CD 40 
ligand, CD 35 ligand etc.), modified proteins (advanced gly-
cation end products, amyloid beta, oxidized LDL etc.) and 
many others can activate NF-κB [57]. The constitutively 
active form of NF-κB, however, is also demonstrated in sev-
eral cell types including neurons [51]. The IkB family of 
proteins comprises of three typical IkBs e.g. IkBα, IkBβ, 
IκBε and atypical members like IkBζ and Bcl3 [51,52]. The 
precursor proteins p100 and p105 of NF-κB family which 
contain ankyrin repeats may also be included in IkB family 
[51]. In general, the formation of a complex of NF-κB dimer 
with a typical member of IkB family prevents the nuclear 
translocation and gene activation function of NF-κB [51,52]. 
The IkB proteins interact through their ankyrin repeat do-
mains, mask the nuclear localization signals in RHDs of NF-
κB dimers and keep the latter in cytosol in inactive form, but 
the complete molecular details of this interaction are far 
more complex and still not clearly understood [51,58]. The 
activation process of NF-κB has been best elucidated in the 
context of IkBα and RelA-p50 dimer. The phosphorylation 
of serine 32 and 36 of IkBα leads to ubiquitnation and pro-
teasomal degradation of IkBα which allows the nuclear 
translocation of NF-κB and upregulation of a large set of 
genes [51,52,59-62]. With other members of IkB family such 
as IkBβ and IkBγ, similar phosphorylation (serine 19 and 23 
for IkBβ or serine 157 and 161 for IkBε) and degradation 
cycles probably occur but with a much delayed kinetics 
[36,51,62]. The precursor proteins p105 and p100 can be-
have like IkB because of the presence of ankyrin repeats and 
can hold the Rel proteins in inactive form in cytosol 
e.g.RelB-p100 dimer [51,52,62,63]. The phosphorylation of 
p100 at serine residues leads to ubiquitination and regulated 
proteasomal degradation to generate p52 and consequent 
activation and nuclear translocation of RelB-p52 dimer of 
NF-κB [51,52,62,63]. Similarly p105 can bind to NF-κB 
dimers preventing their nuclear translocation, but after phos-
phorylation at serine residues near C-terminal region under-
goes complete degradation like IkB proteins [62]. Alterna-
tively, p105 can be constitutively processed to generate p50 
at a low level [51,62]. The phosphorylation of Ikβs is medi-
ated by the IkB kinase complex (IKK) which comprises of 
two kinases IKKα and IKKβ, a regulatory subunit called NF-
κB essential modulator (NEMO) and other additional units 
like ELKS [51,54,62,63]. IKKα and IKKβ have 50% identity 
in amino acid sequence, and each contains a N-terminal 
kinase domain and leucine-zipper domain assisting in di-
merization and a C-terminal helix-loop-helix domain regulat-
ing kinase activity [51,53]. 

CANONICAL AND NON-CANONICAL ACTIVATION 
OF NF-κB 

Although NF-κB is activated by a wide array of stimuli, 
the two alternative pathways of activation can be distin-
guished in terms of the nature of stimulus, the IKK subunits 

involved and IkB substrates used. In the canonical pathway, 
Toll like receptor ligands (pathogen associated molecules 
like LPS, dsRNA), proinflammatory cytokines, genotoxic 
agents etc. activate IKKβ subunit which then phosphorylates 
IkBα or IkBβ without the involvement of NEMO leading to 
NF-κB activation [51,52]. The activation of IKKβ subunit in 
the canonical pathway requires the recruitment of several 
upstream factors like TNF receptor associated factors 
(TRAF) family of proteins and RIP kinase [51,52,62]. In the 
non-canonical pathway, several members of TNF family like 
lymphotoxin β, BAFF, ligands of CD40, CD27 and CD30 
etc. activate IKKα through involvement of TRAF2 and 
TRAF3 and the upstream kinase known as NF-κB inducing 
kinase or NIK [51,52,63,64]. NIK causes phosphorylation 
and activation of IKKα which in turn specifically phosphory-
late p100 subunit of RelB-p100 inactive complex [51,52]. 
The subsequent proteasomal degradation of p100 generates 
p52 causing activation of RelB-p52 dimer of NF-κB as de-
scribed earlier [51,52]. 

ROS and NF-κB 

There is now compelling evidence to suggest that NF-κB 
is a redox-sensitive transcription factor and direct activation 
of NF-κB by H2O2 and other ROS have been demonstrated 
in a number of cell lines in different experimental conditions 
[65-69]. Further, the modulation by H2O2 or superoxide radi-
cals has also been observed when NF-κB activation has been 
induced by cytokines in different cell lines [70,71]. Like-
wise, when cells are exposed to conditions of oxidative stress 
such as hypoxia or reperfusion injury, the activation of NF-
κB by endogenous ROS has been clearly demonstrated 
[66,72,73]. The toxic intermediates of lipid peroxidation, in 
particular 4-hydroxynonenal, also have been shown to be 
involved in NF-κB activation in various experimental condi-
tions [74-76] In conformity with these findings, antioxidants 
of various types and most notably N-acetylcysteine and pyr-
rolidine thiocarbamate have been shown to prevent NF-κB 
activation by different inducers like cytokines, viruses, 
dsRNA, endotoxins, phorbol ester, lipopolysaccharide etc. in 
a large number of cell lines [67,69,75]. The overexpression 
of antioxidant enzymes in cell lines also prevents NF-κB 
activation induced by cytokines or other proinflammatory 
agents [77,78]. However, methodological problems have 
often led to inconsistent results in experiments studying the 
direct actions of ROS on NF-κB signaling in different cell 
lines, and new approaches such as steady-state titration with 
H2O2 have been suggested for rectification of the problem 
[37,79-81]. It is suggested that ROS may be the generic 
modulator of NF-κB signaling system induced by different 
stimuli, but at the same time the action of ROS may be spe-
cific at the level of a single gene [79,81]. Nevertheless, it is 
also to be appreciated that methodology alone is not respon-
sible for varied reports of ROS actions on NF-κB signaling 
pathway. Indeed, ROS can affect NF-κB signaling cascade in 
multiple and often opposing ways that may be cell or tissue 
specific [52,82]. The ROS can affect the NF-κB subunits or 
IkB or IKK directly or indirectly through other upstream 
kinases or phosphatases [52,82]. Thus, oxidation of cys 62 of 
p50 by ROS prevents the DNA binding of NF-kB, whereas 
dimerization of NEMO following disulfide bond formation 
between cys 54 and cys 347 may activate IKK leading to 
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NF-κB activation [52,82]. In contrast, the oxidation of cys 
179 of IKKβ by ROS may inhibit the kinase activity with 
concomitant inactivation of NF-κB [82]. Conversely, ROS 
may cause tyrosine phosphorylation of IkB through SyK and 
CKII activation leading to the release of IkBα from its asso-
ciation with NF-κB dimer of RelA-p50 [52,83]. On the other 
hand, ROS may inhibit ubiquitination of IkBα for subsequent 
proteasomal degradation and thus may suppress or delay the 
NF-κB activation induced by TNF-α as seen in HEK293 cell 
line [70]. These few examples illustrate the multitude of 
mechanisms by which ROS may impact the complex regula-
tion of NF-κB signaling in different conditions [52,82]. Al-
though the ROS mediated activation of NF-κB has been ex-
plored extensively in cell lines and primary culture of mam-
malian cells, the evidence of NF-κB activation is seen in 
many animal models of disease. In several studies ROS de-
pendent NF-κB activation has been documented in animal 
models of lung inflammation, cerebral reperfusion injury, 
endothelial damage and atherogenesis [84-87]. Likewise NF-
κB activation has also been reported in animal models of 
diseases like AD, Parkinson's disease, type 2 diabetes and 
athersclerosis, and interestingly these conditions are all asso-
ciated with increased oxidative stress [53]. Further, age-
related activation or increased DNA binding of NF-κB has 
been reported in various tissues during aging and dietary 
antioxidants have been shown to inhibit nuclear translocation 
of activated NF-κB [53,88].  

As indicated earlier that NF-κB alters the transcription of 
a large array of genes which interestingly also include sev-
eral antioxidant and pro-oxidant genes [52]. The important 
antioxidant enzymes and proteins whose transcriptions are 
regulated by NF-κB include SOD1 and SOD2, glutathione 
peroxidase, glutathione S-transferase, heme oxygenase, fer-
ritin heavy chain, metallothionein-3 and NAD(P)H-quinone 
oxido-reductase [52]. The pro-oxidant genes under NF-
κBcontrol include cycloxygenase-2 (COX 2), inducible nitric 
oxide synthase (iNOS), NADPH oxidase (NOX) and several 
lipoxygenases [52]. 

NF-κB AND ALZHEIMER'S DISEASE 

The above account clearly indicates that NF-κB is a cen-
tral regulator of ROS signaling as well as the inflammatory 
and immune response of the cells and tissues, and it also co-
ordinates the cross-talk between inflammatory mediators and 
ROS in patho-physiological conditions. Seen in this light 
NF-κB signaling is likely to play a crucial role in AD patho-
genesis because both oxidative stress and inflammation are 
key elements of this disorder. Further, transcriptional activa-
tion by NF-κB is also linked to cell survival, differentiation 
and apoptosis which have clear implications in neurodegen-
eration. It will be interesting, therefore, to accumulate the 
evidence that connects NF-κB signaling with AD either in 
post-mortem human brain or in different animal and cell-
based models. 

In post-mortem AD brain, high immunoreactivity for p65 
subunit of NF-κB has been observed in amyloid plaques as 
well as within plaque-adjacent neurons and astroglia indicat-
ing NF-κB activation in this condition [89]. In temporal cor-
tex of post-mortem AD brain, an increased immunoreactivity 
for p65 subunit of NF-κBdimer has been observed compared 

to control [90]. Similarly, immunohistochemistry with poly-
clonal antibody against p65 subunit has revealed an en-
hanced NF-κB content in neurons, dystrophic neurites and 
neurofibrillary tangles in hippocampus and entorhinal cortex 
in post-mortem AD brain compared to control [91]. In an-
other post-mortem study in AD brain, increased immunore-
activity for p65 subunit of NF-κB has been observed in the 
nuclei of neurons, in the vicinity of amyloid plaques, in dif-
fuse β amyloid deposits and in the cytosol of some neurons 
with neurofibrillary tangles [92]. Systematic studies by Lu-
kiw and colleagues have shown abundant presence of severa 
NF-κB regulated microRNAs, miRNA 155, miRNA 146a, 
miRNA 125b and miRNA 9 in the disease affected areas 
compared to unaffected areas in AD brain or similar ana-
tomical regions of age-matched controls [93,94]. These 
miRNAs are known to interfere with mRNAs coding for 
proteins involved in synaptogenesis, inflammatory response, 
neurotrophic functions and amyloidogenesis [94]. In this 
respect it is interesting to point out that certain environ-
mental factors like HSV-1 and aluminium exposure which 
have been implicated in sporadic AD pathogenesis are 
known inducers of NF-κB and proinflammatory miRNA 
expression [93]. 

The evidence of increased NF-κB activity in post-mortem 
AD brain is probably related to increased oxidative stress, 
inflammatory reactions and toxicity of accumulated amyloid 
beta peptides, and experimental studies provide strong sup-
port to this. Thus, a single microinjection of oligomeric 
Aβ42 in rat brain cortex results in an increased expression of 
COX2, IL-1 and TNF-α through activation of NF-κB in reac-
tive astrocytes in the vicinity of the injection site [95]. In 
another study the toxicity of amyloid beta peptide on cell 
lines or primary culture of neurons is mediated by H2O2 and 
lipid peroxides with an increased activation of NF-κB signal-
ing [96]. In neural cell line NG108-15, amyloid beta 42 
causes a loss of cell viability with release of inflammatory 
cytokines TNF-α, MCP-1 and IL-10 through activation of 
JNK and NF-κB [97]. In co-culture of cortical neurons and 
microglia, amyloid beta peptide causes neuronal toxicity and 
death through activation of glial NF-κB which involves ace-
tylation of lys 310 of p65 subunit [98]. In hippocampal neu-
ronal culture, amyloid beta peptide (Aβ40 or Aβ25 - 35) can 
induce cell death with increase in intracellular Ca2+ and 
ROS, and the process is protected by TNF-α or TNF-β 
through activation of NF-κB [99]. In an interesting study it 
has been shown that pretreatment of primary culture of cere-
bellar granule cells to low-dose of Aβ40 or TNF-α prevents 
cell death on a subsequent challenge by a neurotoxic dose of 
Aβ40 [100]. The protective effect of this pre-treatment with 
low-dose of Aβ40 or TNF-α is mediated by NF-κB activa-
tion and involves ROS, since the phenomenon is prevented 
by the antioxidant PDTC [100]. The authors suggest that 
activation of NF-κB by TNF-α or Aβ40 follows an inverted 
U shaped curve, where a low dose activates NF-κB optimally 
through low amount of ROS, but a higher dose produces 
more ROS inactivating p65 subunit of NF-κB [100]. In a 
related study the activation of NF-κB by a low dose of Aβ40 
or Aβ25-35 involving ROS has been demonstrated in pri-
mary culture of neurons [89]. Consistent with the neuropro-
tective action of NF-κB activation, one study has reported 
that TNF-α treatment of SHSY5Y cells upregulates Mn-SOD 

sasanka chakrabarti
Sticky Note
delete










delete: κBcontrol

insert:  κB control








452    Current Topics in Medicinal Chemistry, 2015, Vol. 15, No. 5 Kaur et al. 

gene through NF-κB activation which subsequently protects 
the cells from a challenge by amyloid beta peptide or iron- 
mediated oxidative stress [101]. Another study identifies a 
resistant clone of PC12 cells against oxidative stress with 
constitutively high NF-κB activity [102]. On the contrary, 
Aβ25-35 induced cell death in SHSY5Y cells is said to be 
mediated by ROS, (poly-ADP) ribose polymerase (PARP-1) 
activation and NF-κB activation [103]. Aluminium toxicity 
is an established environmental risk factor for sporadic AD, 
and aluminium sulphate exposed human astroglial cells ex-
hibit upregulation of several NF-κB responsive miRNA like 
miRNA 125b and miRNA 146a, which are also overex-
pressed in AD brain [104]. This effect of aluminium sulfate 
can be prevented by antioxidants like phenyl butyl nitrone 
(PBN) and PDTC indicating the involvement of ROS in 
aluminium induced NF-κB activation [104]. In murine brain 
mixed co-culture of astrocytes-neurons-microglia, amyloid 
beta peptide induces inflammatory response and apoptosis 
through activation of double-stranded RNA dependent 
kinase (PKR) and NF-κB signaling, and specific inhibitors of 
PKR prevent the amyloid beta toxicity [105]. Thus, the re-
sults from these various studies do clearly show that the acti-
vation of NF-κB by ROS or inflammatory mediators could 
be either neuroprotective or neurotoxic under different con-
ditions which imply that the regulation could be really com-
plex under in vivo scenario. Thus, the increased NF-κB acti-
vation in post-mortem AD brain could either be a protective 
response or a trigger for neurodegeneration and apoptosis, 
and at least one reason for this uncertainty lies in the fact that 
NF-κB activation leads to both upregulation of pro-survival 
and pro-apoptotic genes or pro-oxidant and antioxidant 
genes [52]. Another important issue in the NF-κB and AD 
connection is the regulation of amyloid beta homeostasis 
through transcriptional upregulation of various related en-
zymes and proteins especially APP and BACE1 [106]. The 
type 1 integral protein APP is coded by a gene located in 
chromosome 21and undergoes alternative splicing to gener-
ate several isoforms of the protein of which the one with 695 
amino acids is present in the brain [107]. The 5' regulatory 
regions of APP gene in rat and human have considerable 
homology and contain the binding sites for Sp1, AP-1, AP-2, 
AP-4, GCF etc. [108,109]. Further, a binding site for NF-κB 
family of proteins has been mapped in the regulatory region 
of APP gene [110]. The BACE1 enzyme plays a critical role 
in amyloidogenic processing of APP, and an increased activ-
ity of this enzyme is seen in AD post-mortem brain and cor-
related with increased Aβ peptide load [111,112]. The tran-
scriptional regulation of BACE1 gene by NF-κB is complex, 
but under conditions of Aβ overload the upregulation of 
BACE1 gene may occur through NF-κB activation 
[113,114]. A recent study has shown that in HEK293 cell 
line under physiological conditions, NF-κB actually down-
regulates the expression rates of genes for APP, BACE1 and 
several components of γ-secretase complex, but when these 
cells are overexpressing wild-type or mutated APP gene and 
having an overload of Aβ peptides, NF-κB activation posi-
tively modulates all these genes [115]. Thus, NF-κB upregu-
lation in AD brain actually sustains a vicious cycle where 
increased Aβ peptide load further enhances its synthesis 
from the precursor protein (Fig. 2). The upregulation of 
BACE 1 by 27-hydroxycholesterol, an oxidation product of 
cholesterol, in SHSY5Y cells also requires NF-κB activation 

as well as the involvement of the gadd153 gene (growth ar-
rest and DNA damage induced gene 153), and in triple 
transgenic AD mice the deposition of amyloid β peptide is 
preceded by the increased activity of NF-κB and gadd153 
[116]. 
Inhibitors of NF-κB: Therapeutic Potential in AD 

The complexity of NF-κB activation apparent from the 
discussion already presented, makes it a little uncertain 
whether the inhibitors or activators of NF-κB would be ef-
fective in halting the progression of AD pathology [117]. 
Agents targeting the NF-κB pathway can act at various lev-
els. One possible site would be upstream of NF-κB where 
triggering stimuli like ROS, viruses, Aβ, cytokines and many 
others act. Downstream miRNAs, inflammatory mediators, 
pro-oxidant gene products may also serve as potential tar-
gets, while a third approach would be to target NF-κB itself 
[118,119]. 

Inhibiting the triggers of NF-κB signaling cascade by an-
tioxidants or specific antagonists of cytokines have been 
attempted in experimental models and clinical trials of AD. 
However, ROS and cytokines act at various levels in AD 
pathogenesis and not exclusively through NF-κB signaling 
cascade. Although varieties of antioxidants, synthetic or pre-
sent in natural products, have shown promise in mitigating 
the disease pathology in experimental models of AD, the 
large scale clinical trials have been disappointing 
[3,120,121]. IL-1 receptor antagonist has given good results 
in stroke models, but there is no convincing evidence of their 
usefulness in AD [122]. Compounds like etanercept targeting 
TNF-α have shown improvement in the clinical profile of 
AD but on a limited scale with improvement of aphasia and 
verbal fluency following cerebrospinal fluid administration 
of etanercept [123,124]. 

The direct inhibition of NF-κB by various means has 
provided some encouraging results in cell based AD models. 
This can be accomplished in many ways like preventing ac-
tivation of IKK, inhibiting the phosphorylation of IkB, tar-
geting proteosome mediated degradation of IkB, interfering 
with the translocation of RelA-p50 dimer to nucleus, oxidiz-
ing p65 subunit at critical cysteine residues or deacetylating 
p65 subunit and using decoy nucleotides which competi-
tively inhibit the binding of p65/p50 dimer to the consensus 
sequence of NF-κB DNA binding site [118,119,125]. For 
example, Aβ40 induced translocation of NF-κB to nucleus 
and degeneration of cells in primary culture of neurons has 
been blocked by the decoy oligonucleotide of kB site on 
DNA, the specific inhibitor of IKK AS602868 and the anti-
inflammatory agent aspirin [126]. The compound, xyloco-
side G, present in a Chinese medicinal plant, protects amy-
loid beta induced apoptosis in SHSY5Y cells and primary 
neurons by preventing nuclear translocation of NF-κB [127]. 
Oridonin, obtained from Rabdosia rubescence, prevents 
apoptosis, glial activation, release of cytokines and inflam-
mation in the hippocampus of Aβ42 induced AD mice and 
also prevents NF-κB activation [128]. Many natural com-
pounds like curcumin, resveratrol, epigallocatechin-3-gallate 
etc. can prevent microglial activation and inflammatory re-
sponse in various models including AD experimental mod-
els, and NF-κB inhibition partly accounts for their beneficial 
action [129,130]. Several studies have shown that NF-κB 
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Fig. (2). NFκB in AD pathogenesis. This simplified diagram shows the different interactions of ROS and inflammatory mediators with AD 
pathogenesis through NF-κB activation. NF-κB induced upregulation of APP and BACE1 occurs under conditions of Aβ overload. SYN2- 
Synapsin2; CFH- Complement factor H ; TSPAN12- Tetraspanin 12; LOX- Lipoxygenase. 
 
inhibitors which are known to prevent Aβ induced toxicity in 
experimental models can also reduce amyloid peptide load of 
the cells overexpressing APP or of brain in experimental AD 
models [131,132]. We have provided examples where NF-
κB inhibitors have been useful in preventing amyloid beta 
related toxicity or altering amyloid beta load in different 
experimental models, and some of these may lead to the de-
velopment of new therapeutic agents against AD. However, 
there are other specific NF-κB inhibitors e.g. IKK-NBD, 
TAT-NBD, selective 5-lipoxygenase inhibitor etc. which 
have shown promise in preventing ischemic brain injury in 
different experimental systems and their efficacy should also 
be tested in AD animal or cell-based models [133-135]. It 
has been shown that p38 MAP kinase activity regulates tran-
scriptional activity of NF-kB, and in AD brain p38 activity is 
increased [136,137]. An orally active p38 inhibitor MW01-
2-069A-SRM is found to inhibit cytokine production, pre-
vent loss of synaptophysin and improve behavioral deficit in 
a mouse model of AD [138]. 

NF-κB not only regulates a large number of protein-
coding genes, but also many miRNAs including some like 
mi146a, mi125b which are upregulated in PD brain and im-
plicated in PD pathogenesis [88,89]. A relatively novel ap-
proach for neuroprotection that may be useful in AD is to 
shut down the NF-κB dependent miRNAs activated by NF-
κB using anti-miRNA or antagomir i.e. a 100% complemen-
tary oligonucleotide sequence to miRNA [139]. The biggest 
advantage of targeting miRNAs rather than NF-κB is that 
“culprit” miRNAs are effectively inhibited without having 
much impact on the critical functions of the cell. Though not 
devoid of ‘off target’ effects, the approach is relatively more 
specific than inhibiting NF-κB which is often met with ho-
meostatic disturbances. 

CONCLUSION 

AD not only impairs the quality of life of the patient but 
poses a great burden to economy and society. The nature of 
primary mediators of the AD cascade is still shrouded in 
mystery, but ROS signaling and inflammatory response play 
crucial roles. Various studies have focused on the inflamma-
tory and oxidative components of AD that are linked to the 
transcription factor NF-κB. So far, the approved therapies for 
AD including cholinesterase inhibitors and memantine have 
not lived up to the expectation of disease modifying agents. 
Therein lies the enthusiasm of targeting the NF-κB signaling 
cascade to gain new insight into disease pathogenesis and 
identify potential disease modifying agents. 

CONFLICT OF INTEREST 

The authors confirm that this article content has no con-
flict of interest. 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENTS 

The authors wish to thank the Department of Science and 
Technology, Indian Council of Medical Research and De-
partment of Biotechnology, New Delhi for their continued 
support to the communicating author for research in the field 
of neurodegenerative disorders. 

REFERENCES 
[1] Smith, M.A.; Rottkamp, C.A.; Nunomura, A.; Raina, A.K.; Perry, 

G. Oxidative stress in Alzheimer’s disease. Biochim. Biophys. Acta, 
2000, 1502, 139-144. 

[2] Zhao, Y.; Zhao, B. Oxidative stress and the pathogenesis of Alz-
heimer’s disease. Oxid. Med. Cell. Longev., 2013, 2013, 316523. 

[3] Chakrabarti, S.; Sinha, M.; Thakurta, I.G.; Banerjee, P.; 
Chattopadhyay, M. Oxidative stress and amyloid beta toxicity in 



454    Current Topics in Medicinal Chemistry, 2015, Vol. 15, No. 5 Kaur et al. 

Alzheimer's disease: intervention in a complex relationship by anti-
oxidants. Curr. Med. Chem., 2013, 20, 4648-4664. 

[4] Butterfield, D.A.; Poon, H.F.; St. Clair, D.; Keller, J.N.; Pierce, 
W.M.; Klein, J.B.; Markesbery, W.R. Redox proteomics identifica-
tion of oxidatively modified hippocampal proteins in mild cogni-
tive impairment: insights into the development of Alzheimer's dis-
ease. Neurobiol. Dis., 2006, 22, 223-232.  

[5] Sultana, R.;Poon, H.F.; Cai, J.; Pierce, W.M.; Merchant, M.; Klein, 
J.B.; Markesbery, W.R.; Butterfield, D.A. Identification of nitrated 
proteins in Alzheimer's disease brain usinga redox proteomics ap-
proach. Neurobiol. Dis., 2006, 22, 76-87. 

[6]  Sultana, R.; Perluigi, M.; Butterfield, DA. Lipid peroxidation 
triggers neurodegeneration: a redox proteomics view into the Alz-
heimer disease brain. Free Radic. Biol. Med., 2013, 62, 157-169. 

[7] Pocernich, CB.; Butterfield, D.A. Elevation of glutathione as a 
therapeutic strategy in Alzheimer disease. Biochim. Biophys. Acta., 
2012, 1822, 625-630. 

[8] Butterfield, D.A.; Swomley, A.M.; Sultana, R. Amyloid β-peptide 
(1-42)-induced oxidative stress in Alzheimer disease: importance in 
disease pathogenesis and progression. Antioxid. Redox. Signal., 
2013, 19, 823-835. 

[9] White, A.R.; Multhaup, G.; Maher, F.; Bellingham, S.; Camakaris, 
J.; Zheng, H.; Bush, A.I.; Beyreuther, K.; Masters, C.L.; Cappai, R. 
The Alzheimer's disease amyloid precursor protein modulates cop-
per-induced toxicity and oxidative stress in primary neuronal cul-
tures. J. Neurosci., 1999, 19, 9170-9179. 

[10] Sperling, R.A.; Aisen, P.S.; Beckett, L.A.; Bennett, D.A.; Craft, S.; 
Fagan, A.M.; Iwatsubo, T.; Jack, C.R. Jr.; Kaye, J.; Montine, T.J.; 
Park, D.C.; Reiman, E.M.; Rowe, C.C.; Siemers, E.; Stern, Y.; 
Yaffe, K.; Carrillo, M.C.; Thies, B.; Morrison-Bogorad, M.; 
Wagster, M.V.; Phelps, C.H. Toward defining the preclinical stages 
of Alzheimer's disease: recommendations from the National Insti-
tute on Aging-Alzheimer's Association workgroups on diagnostic 
guidelines for Alzheimer's disease. Alzheimers Dement., 2011, 7, 
280-292. 

[11]  Albert, M.S.; DeKosky, S.T.; Dickson, D.; Dubois, B.; Feldman, 
H.H.; Fox, N.C.; Gamst, A.; Holtzman, D.M.; Jagust, W.J.; 
Petersen, R.C.; Snyder, P.J.; Carrillo, M.C.; Thies, B.; Phelps, C.H. 
The diagnosis of mild cognitive impairment due to Alzheimer's 
disease: recommendations from the National Institute on Aging-
Alzheimer's Association workgroups on diagnostic guidelines for 
Alzheimer's disease. Alzheimers Dement., 2011, 7, 270-279. 

[12] McKhann, G.M.; Knopman, D.S.; Chertkow, H.; Hyman, B.T.; 
Jack, C.R. Jr.; Kawas, C.H.; Klunk, W.E.; Koroshetz, W.J.; Manly, 
J.J.; Mayeux, R.; Mohs, R.C.; Morris, J.C.; Rossor, M.N.; 
Scheltens, P.; Carrillo, M.C.; Thies, B.; Weintraub, S.; Phelps, C.H. 
The diagnosis of dementia due to Alzheimer's disease: recommen-
dations from the National Institute on Aging-Alzheimer's Associa-
tion workgroups on diagnostic guidelines for Alzheimer's disease. 
Alzheimers Dement., 2011, 7, 263-269. 

[13] Barclay, L.L.; Zemcov, A.; Blass, J.P.; Sansone, J. Survival in AD 
and VDs. Neurology, 1985, 35, 834-840. 

[14] Duthey, B. Background paper (WHO) 2013, 6.11. Alzheimer dis-
ease and other dementias. 6.11:4-74. 

[15] Rogaeva, E.; Kawarai, T.; George-Hyslop, P.S. Genetic complexity 
of Alzheimer's disease: successes and challenges. J. Alzheimers 
Dis., 2006, 9(3 Suppl), 381-387. 

[16] Reitz, C.; Brayne, C.; Mayeux, R. Epidemiology of Alzheimers 
disease. Nat. Rev. Neurol.,2011, 7, 137-152. 

[17]  Serrano-Pozo, A.;Frosch, M.P.; Masliah, E.; Hyman, B.T. Neuro-
pathological alterations in Alzheimer disease. Cold Spring Harb. 
Perspect. Med.,2011, 1, a006189. 

[18] Montine, T.J.; Phelps, C.H.; Beach, T.G.; Bigio, E.H.; Cairns, N.J.; 
Dickson, D.W.; Duyckaerts, C.; Frosch, M.P.; Masliah, E.; Mirra, 
S.S.; Nelson, P.T.; Schneider, J.A.; Thal, D.R.; Trojanowski, J.Q.; 
Vinters, H.V.; Hyman, B.T. National Institute on Aging-
Alzheimer's Association guidelines for the neuropathologic as-
sessment of Alzheimer's disease: a practical approach. Acta 
Neuropathol., 2012, 123, 1-11. 

[19] Swerdlow, R.H. Pathogenesis of Alzheimer’s disease. Clin. Inter-
ven. Aging, 2007, 2, 347-359. 

[20] Suh, Y.H.; Checler, F. Amyloid precursor protein, presenilins, and 
alpha-synuclein: molecular pathogenesis and pharmacological ap-
plications in Alzheimer's disease. Pharmacol. Rev., 2002, 54, 469-
525. 

[21] Dong, S.; Duan, Y.; Hu, Y.; Zhao, Z. Advances in the pathogenesis 
of Alzheimer's disease: a re-evaluation of amyloid cascade hy-
pothesis. Transl. Neurodegener., 2012, 1, 18. 

[22] Johnson, G.V.; Stoothoff, W.H. Tau phosphorylation in neuronal 
cell function and dysfunction. J. Cell Sci., 2004, 117, 5721-5729. 

[23]  Haass, C.; Kaether, C.; Thinakaran, G.; Sisodia, S. Trafficking and 
proteolytic processing of APP. Cold Spring Harb. Perspect. Med., 
2012, 2, a006270. 

[24] Jiang, T.; Yu, J.T.; Tan, L. Novel disease-modifying therapies for 
Alzheimer's disease. J. Alzheimers Dis., 2012, 31, 475-492. 

[25] Townsend, M. When will Alzheimer's disease be cured? A phar-
maceutical perspective. J. Alzheimers Dis., 2011, 24 Suppl 2, 43-
52. 

[26] Wyss-Coray T, Rogers J. Inflammation in Alzheimer disease-a 
brief review of the basic science and clinical literature. Cold Spring 
Harb. Perspect Med., 2012, 2, a006346. 

[27] Weisman, D.; Hakimian, E.; Ho, G.J. Interleukins, inflammation, 
and mechanisms of Alzheimer's disease. Vitam. Horm., 2006, 74, 
505-530. 

[28] Akiyama, H.; Barger, S.; Barnum, S.; Bradt, B.; Bauer, J.; Cole, 
G.M.; Cooper, N.R.; Eikelenboom, P.; Emmerling, M.; Fiebich, 
B.L.; Finch, C.E.; Frautschy, S.; Griffin, W.S.; Hampel, H.; Hull, 
M.; Landreth, G.; Lue, L.; Mrak, R.; Mackenzie, I.R.; McGeer, 
P.L.; O'Banion, M.K.; Pachter, J.; Pasinetti, G.; Plata-Salaman, C.; 
Rogers, J.; Rydel, R.; Shen, Y.; Streit, W.; Strohmeyer, R.; 
Tooyoma, I.; Van Muiswinkel, F.L.; Veerhuis, R.; Walker, D.; 
Webster, S.; Wegrzyniak, B.; Wenk, G.; Wyss-Coray, T. Inflam-
mation and Alzheimer's disease. Neurobiol. Aging, 2000, 21, 383-
421. 

[29] Bamberger, M.E.; Harris, M.E.; McDonald, D.R.; Husemann, J.; 
Landreth, G.E. A cell surface receptor complex for fibrillar beta-
amyloid mediates microglial activation. J. Neurosci., 2003, 23, 
2665-2674. 

[30] Enciu, A.M.; Popescu, B.O. Is there a causal link between inflam-
mation and dementia? Biomed. Res. Int., 2013, 2013, 316495. 

[31] Kaltschmidt, B.; Kaltschmidt, C. NF-κBin the Nervous System. 
Cold Spring Harb. Perspect. Biol., 2009, 1:a001271. 

[32] Granic, I.; Dolga, A.M.; Nijholt, I.M.; Dijk, G.V.; Eisel, U.L.M. 
Inflammation and NF-κB in Alzheimer’s Disease and Diabetes . J. 
Alzheimer’s Dis., 2009, 16, 809-821. 

[33] Murphy, M.A. How mitochondria produce reactive oxygen species. 
Biochem. J., 2009, 417, 1-13. 

[34] Chiarugi, P.; Fiaschi, T.; Taddei, M.L.; Talini, D.; Giannoni, E.; 
Raugei, G.; Ramponi, G. Two vicinal cysteines confer a peculiar 
redox regulation to low molecular weight protein tyrosine phospha-
tase inresponse to platelet-derived growth factor receptor stimula-
tion. J. Biol. Chem., 2001, 276, 33478-33487. 

[35] Wilmer, W.A.; Tan, L.C.; Dickerson, J.A.; Danne, M.; Rovin, B.H. 
Interleukin-1beta induction of mitogen-activated protein kinases in 
human mesangial cells. Role of oxidation. J. Biol. Chem., 1997, 
272, 10877-10881. 

[36] Bae, Y.S.; Kang, S.W.; Seo, M.S.; Baines, I.C.; Tekle, E.; Chock, 
P.B.; Rhee, S.G. Epidermal growth factor (EGF)induced generation 
of hydrogen peroxide. Role in EGF receptor-mediated tyrosi-
nephosphorylation. J. Biol. Chem., 1997, 272, 217-221. 

[37] Li, N.; Karin, M. Is NF-kappaB the sensor of oxidative stress? 
FASEB J., 1999, 13, 1137-1143. 

[38] Marinho, H.S.; Real, C.; Cyrne, L.; Soares, H.; Antunes, F. Hydro-
gen peroxide sensing, signaling and regulation of transcription fac-
tors. Redox Biol., 2014, 23, 535-562. 

[39] Finkel, T. Signal transduction by reactive oxygen species. J. Cell 
Biol., 2011, 194, 7-15. 

[40] Collins, Y.; Chouchani, E.T.; James, A.M.; Menger, K.E.; 
Cochemé, H.M.; Murphy, M.P. Mitochondrial redox signalling at a 
glance. J. Cell. Sci., 2012, 125, 801-806. 

[41] Wong, C.M.; Cheema, A.K.; Zhang, L.; Suzuki, YJ. Protein car-
bonylation as a novel mechanism in redox signaling. Circ. Res., 
2008, 102, 310-318. 

[42] Bashan, N.; Kovsan, J.; Kachko, I.; Ovadia, H.; Rudich, A. Positive 
and negative regulation of insulin signaling by reactive oxygen and 
nitrogen species. Physiol. Rev., 2009, 89, 27-71. 

[43] Truong, T.H.; Carroll, K.S. Redox regulation of protein kinases. 
Crit. Rev. Biochem. Mol. Biol., 2013, 48, 332-356 . 

[44] Genestra, M. Oxyl radicals, redox-sensitive signalling cascades and 
antioxidants. Cell Signal., 2007, 19, 1807-1819. 



Reactive Oxygen Species, Redox Signaling and Neuroinflammation Current Topics in Medicinal Chemistry, 2015, Vol. 15, No. 5    455 

[45] Mohora, M.; Greabu, M.; Totan, A.; Mitrea, M.; Battino, M. Re-
dox-sensitive signalling factors and antioxidants. Farmacia, 2009, 
57, 399-411. 

[46] Trachootham, D.; Lu, W.; Ogasawara, M.A.; Nilsa, R.D.; Huang, 
P. Redox regulation of cell survival. Antioxid. Redox Signal., 2008, 
10, 1343-1374. 

[47]  Piantadosi, CA.; Suliman, H.B.Mitochondrial transcription factor 
A induction by redox activation of nuclear respiratory factor 1. J. 
Biol. Chem., 2006, 281, 30324-30333. 

[48] Bonello, S.; Zähringer, C.; BelAiba, R.S.; Djordjevic, T.; Hess, J.; 
Michiels, C.; Kietzmann, T.; Görlach, A. Reactive Oxygen Species 
Activate the HIF-1a Promoter Via a Functional NFkB Site. Arterio-
scler. Thromb. Vasc. Biol., 2007, 27, 755-761. 

[49] Ahn, S.G.;Thiele, D.J.Redox regulation of mammalian heat shock 
factor 1 is essential for Hsp gene activation and protection from 
stress. Genes Dev., 2003, 17, 516-528. 

[50] Dinkova-Kostova, A.T.; Holtzclaw, W.D.; Cole, R.N.; Itoh, K.; 
Wakabayashi, N.; Katoh, Y.; Yamamoto, M.; Talalay, P. Direct 
evidence that sulfhydryl groups of Keap1 are the sensors regulating 
induction of phase 2 enzymes that protect against carcinogens and 
oxidants. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. U S A., 2002, 99, 11908 -11913. 

[51] Oeckinghaus, A.; Ghosh, S. The NF-kappaB family of transcription 
factors and its regulation. Perspect. Biol., 2009, 1:a000034. 

[52] Morgan, M.J.; Liu, Z.G. Crosstalk of reactive oxygen species and 
NF-κB signaling. Cell Res., 2011, 21, 103-115. 

[53] Tilstra, J.S.; Clauson, C.L.; Niedernhofer, L.J.; Robbins, P.D. NF-
κB in aging and disease. Aging Dis., 2011, 2, 449-465. 

[54] Kaltschmidt, B.;Widera, D.; Kaltschmidt, C. Signaling via NF-
kappaB in the nervous system. Biochim. Biophys. Acta., 2005, 
1745, 287-299. 

[55] Rape, M.; Jentsch, S. Productive RUPture: activation of transcrip-
tion factors by proteasomal processing. Biochim. Biophys. Acta, 
2004, 1695, 209-213. 

[56] Adib-Conquy, M.; Adrie, C.; Moine, P.; Asehnoune, K.; Fitting, 
C.; Pinsky, M.R.; Dhainaut, J.F.; Cavaillon, J.M. NF-kappaB ex-
pression in mononuclear cells of patients with sepsis resembles that 
observed in lipopolysaccharide tolerance. Am. J. Respir. Crit. Care 
Med., 2000, 162, 1877-1883. 

[57] Pahl, H.L. Activators and target genes of Rel/NF-kappaB transcrip-
tion factors. Oncogene, 1999, 18, 6853-6866. 

[58] Malek, S.; Huxford, T.; Ghosh, G. Ikappa Balpha functions through 
direct contacts with the nuclear localization signals and the DNA 
binding sequences of NF-kappaB. J. Biol. Chem., 1998, 273, 
25427-25435. 

[59] Traenckner, E.B.; Pahl, H.L.; Henkel, T.; Schmidt, K.N.; Wilk, S.; 
Baeuerle, P.A. Phosphorylation of human I kappa B-alpha on seri-
nes 32 and 36 controls I kappa B-alpha proteolysis and NF-kappa B 
activation in response to diverse stimuli. EMBO J., 1995, 14, 2876-
2883. 

[60] Chen, Z.; Hagler, J.; Palombella, V.J.; Melandri, F.; Scherer, D.; 
Ballard, D.; Maniatis, T.Signal-induced site-specific phosphoryla-
tion targets I kappa B alpha to the ubiquitin-proteasome pathway. 
Genes Dev., 1995, 9, 1586-1597. 

[61] Traenckner, E.B.; Wilk, S.; Baeuerle, P.A. A proteasome inhibitor 
prevents activation of NF-kappa B and stabilizes a newly 
phosphorylated form of I kappa B-alpha that is still bound to NF-
kappa B. EMBO J., 1994, 13, 5433-5441. 

[62] Hayden, M.S.; Ghosh, S. Shared principles in NF-kappaB signal-
ing. Cell., 2008, 132, 344-362. 

[63] Kim, J.Y.; Morgan, M.; Kim, D.G.; Lee, J.Y.; Bai, L.; Lin, Y.; Liu, 
Z.G.; Kim, Y.S. TNFα induced noncanonical NF-κB activation is 
attenuated by RIP1 through stabilization of TRAF2. J. Cell Sci., 
2011, 124, 647-656. 

[64] Sun SC. Non-canonical NF-κB signaling pathway.Cell Res., 2011, 
21, 71-85. 

[65] Volanti, C.; Matroule, J.Y.; Piette, J. Involvement of oxidative 
stress in NF-kappaB activation in endothelial cells treated by pho-
todynamic therapy. Photochem. Photobiol., 2002, 75, 36-45. 

[66] Canty, T.G. Jr.; Boyle, E.M. Jr.; Farr, A.; Morgan, E.N.; Verrier, 
E.D.; Pohlman, T.H. Oxidative stress induces NF-kappaB nuclear 
translocation without degradation of IkappaBalpha. Circulation, 
1999, 100(19 Suppl), II361-II364. 

[67]  Schreck, R.; Albermann, K.; Baeuerle, P.A. Nuclear Factor Kb: 
An Oxidative Stress-Responsive Transcription Factor of Eukaryotic 
Cells. Informa Healthcare, 1992, 17, 221-237. 

[68] Musonda, C.A.; Chipman, J.K. Quercetin inhibits hydrogen perox-
ide (H2O2)-induced NF-kappaB DNA binding activity and DNA 
damage in HepG2 cells. Carcinogenesis, 1998, 19, 1583-1589. 

[69] Schreck, R.; Rieber, P.; Baeuerle, P.A. Reactive oxygen intermedi-
ates as apparently widely used messengers in the activation of the 
NF-kappa B transcription factor and HIV-1. EMBO. J., 1991, 10, 
2247-2258. 

[70] Lee, Y.; Choi, J.; Ha, K.H.; Jue, D.M. Transient exposure to hy-
drogen peroxide inhibits the ubiquitination of phosphorylated IκBα 
in TNFα-stimulated HEK293 cells. Exp. Mol. Med., 2012, 44, 513-
520. 

[71] Mendes, A.F.; Caramona, M.M.; Carvalho, A.P.; Lopes, 
M.C.Differential roles of hydrogen peroxide and superoxide in me-
diating IL-1-induced NF-kappa B activation and iNOS expression 
in bovine articular chondrocytes. J. Cell. Biochem., 2003, 88, 783-
793. 

[72]  Collard, C.D.; Agah, A.; Stahl, G.L. Complement activation fol-
lowing reoxygenation of hypoxic human endothelial cells: role of 
intracellular reactive oxygen species, NF-kappaB and new protein 
synthesis. Immunopharmacology, 1998, 39, 39-50. 

[73] Nichols, T.C. NF-κB and Reperfusion Injury. Drug News Per-
spect., 2004, 17, 99. 

[74] Ruef, J.; Moser, M.; Bode, C.; Kübler, W.; Runge, M.S. 4-
hydroxynonenal induces apoptosis, NF-kappaB-activation and for-
mation of 8-isoprostane in vascular smooth muscle cells. Basic Res. 
Cardiol., 2001, 96, 143-150. 

[75] Bowie, A.G.; Moynagh, P.N.; O'Neill, L.A. Lipid peroxidation is 
involved in the activation of NF-kappaB by tumor necrosis factor 
but not interleukin-1 in the human endothelial cell line ECV304. 
Lack of involvement of H2O2 in NF-kappaB activation by either cy-
tokine in both primary and transformed endothelial cells. J. Biol. 
Chem., 1997, 272, 25941-25950. 

[76] Yadav, U.C.; Ramana, K.V. Regulation of NF-κB-induced inflam-
matory signaling by lipid peroxidation-derived aldehydes. Oxid. 
Med. Cell. Longev., 2013, 2013:690545. 

[77] Kretz-Remy, C.; Mehlen, P.; Mirault, M.E.; Arrigo, A.P. Inhibition 
of I kappa B-alpha phosphorylation and degradation and subse-
quent NF-kappa B activation by glutathione peroxidase overex-
pression. J. Cell. Biol., 1996, 133, 1083-1093. 

[78] Lüpertz, R.; Chovolou, Y.; Kampkötter, A.; Wätjen, W.; Kahl, R. 
Catalase overexpression impairs TNF-α induced NF-κB activation 
and sensitizes MCF-7 cells against TNF-α. J. Cell. Biochem., 2008, 
103, 1497-1511. 

[79] Oliveira-Marques, V.; Marinho, H.S.; Cyrne, L.; Antunes, F. Role 
of hydrogen peroxide in NF-kappaB activation: from inducer to 
modulator. Antioxid. Redox Signal., 2009, 11, 2223-2243. 

[80] Byun, M.S.; Jeon, K.I.; Choi, J.W.; Shim, J.Y.; Jue, D.M. Dual 
effect of oxidative stress on NF-kappakB activation in HeLa cells. 
Exp. Mol. Med., 2002, 34, 332-339. 

[81] Cyrne, L.; Oliveira-Marques, V.; Marinho, H.S.; Antunes, F. In: 
Methods in Enzymology; Enrique Cadenas and Lester Packer, Ed.; 
Academic Press: Burlington, 2013,528, 173-188. 

[82] Siomek, A. NF-κB signaling pathway and free radical impact. Acta 
Biochim. Pol., 2012, 59, 323-331. 

[83] Imbert, V.; Rupec, R.A.; Livolsi, A.; Pahl, H.L.; Traenckner, E.B.; 
Mueller- Dieckmann, C.; Farahifar, D.; Rossi, B.; Auberger, P.; 
Baeuerle, P.A.; Peyron, J.F. Tyrosine phosphorylation of IkBa acti-
vates NF-κBwithout proteolytic degradation of IkBa. Cell, 1996, 
86, 787-798. 

[84] Blackwell, T.S.; Blackwell, T.R.; Holden, E.P.; Christman, B.W.; 
Christman, J.W. In vivo antioxidant treatment suppresses nuclear 
factor-kappa B activation and neutrophilic lung inflammation. J. 
Immunol., 1996, 157, 1630-1637. 

[85] Carroll, J.E.; Howard, E.F.; Hess, D.C.; Wakade, C.G.; Chen, Q.; 
Cheng, C. Nuclear factor-kappa B activation during cerebral reper-
fusion: effect of attenuation with N-acetylcysteine treatment. Brain 
Res. Mol. Brain Res., 1998, 56, 186-191. 

[86] Han, W.; Li, H.; Cai, J.; Gleaves, L.A.; Polosukhin, V.V.; Segal, 
B.H.; Yull, F.E.; Blackwell, T.S. NADPH oxidase limits lipopoly-
saccharide-induced lung inflammation and injury in mice through 
reduction-oxidation regulation of NF- kB activity. J. Immunol., 
2013, 190, 4786-4794. 

[87] Zinovkin, R.A.; Romaschenko R.P.; Galkin, I.I.; Zakharova, V.V.; 
Pletjushkina, O.Y.; Chernyak, B.V.; Popova, E.N. Role of mito-
chondrial reactive oxygen species in age-­‐related inflammatory acti-
vation of endothelium. Aging, 2014, 6, 661-674. 



456    Current Topics in Medicinal Chemistry, 2015, Vol. 15, No. 5 Kaur et al. 

[88] Thakurta, I.G.; Chattopadhyay, M.; Ghosh, A.; Chakrabarti, S. 
Dietary supplementation with N-acetyl cysteine, α-tocopherol and 
α -lipoic acid reduces the extent of oxidative stress and proinflam-
matory state in aged rat brain. Biogerontology, 2012, 13, 479-488. 

[89] Kaltschmidt, B.; Uherek, M.; Volk, B.; Baeuerle, P.A.; 
Kaltschmidt, C. Transcription factor NF-kappaB is activated in 
primary neurons by amyloid beta peptides and in neurons surround-
ing early plaques from patients with Alzheimer disease. Proc. Natl. 
Acad. Sci. USA, 1997, 94, 2642-2647. 

[90] Kitamura, Y.; Shimohama, S.; Ota, T.; Matsuoka, Y.; Nomura, Y.; 
Taniguchi, T. Alteration of transcription factors NF-kappaB and 
STAT1 in Alzheimer's disease brains. Neurosci. Lett., 1997, 237, 
17-20. 

[91] Terai, K.; Matsuo, A.; McGeer, P.L. Enhancement of immunoreac-
tivity for NF-kappa B in the hippocampal formation and cerebral 
cortex of Alzheimer's disease. Brain Res., 1996, 735, 159-168. 

[92] Ferrer, I.; Martí, E.; López, E.; Tortosa, A. NF-
κBimmunoreactivity is observed in association with beta A4 dif-
fuse plaques in patients with Alzheimer's disease. Neuropathol. 
Appl. Neurobiol., 1998, 24, 271-277. 

[93]  Lukiw, W.J. NF-κB-regulated, proinflammatory miRNAs in Alz-
heimer's disease. Alzheimers Res. Ther., 2012, 4, 47. doi: 
10.1186/alzrt150. eCollection 2012. 

[94] Lukiw, W.J.; Andreeva, T.V.; Grigorenko, A.P.; Rogaev, E.I. 
Studying micro RNA function and dysfunction in Alzheimer's dis-
ease. Front. Genet.,2013, 3, 327. doi: 10.3389/fgene.2012.00327. 
eCollection 2012. 

[95] Carrero, I.; Gonzalo, M.R.; Martin, B.; Sanz-Anquela, J.M.; 
Arévalo-Serrano, J.; Gonzalo-Ruiz, A. Oligomers of β-amyloid 
protein (Aβ1-42) induce the activation of cyclooxygenase-2 in as-
trocytes via an interaction with interleukin-1β, tumour necrosis fac-
tor-α, and a nuclear factor κ-B mechanism in the rat brain. Exp. 
Neurol., 2012, 236, 215-227. 

[96] Behl, C.; Davis, J.B.; Lesley, R.; Schubert, D. Hydrogen peroxide 
mediates amyloid beta protein toxicity. Cell, 1994, 77, 817-827. 

[97] Lin, W.; Ding, M.; Xue, J.; Leng, W. The role of TLR2/JNK/NF-
κB pathway in amyloid β peptide-induced inflammatory response 
in mouse NG108-15 neural cells. Int. Immunopharmacol., 2013, 
17, 880-884. 

[98] Chen, J.; Zhou, Y.; Mueller-Steiner, S.; Chen, L.F.; Kwon, H.; Yi, 
S.; Mucke, L.; Gan, L. SIRT1 protects against microglia-dependent 
amyloid-beta toxicity through inhibiting NF-kappaB signaling. J. 
Biol. Chem., 2005, 280, 40364-40374. 

[99] Barger, S.W.; Hörster, D.; Furukawa, K.; Goodman, Y.; 
Krieglstein, J.; Mattson, M.P. Tumor necrosis factors alpha and 
beta protect neurons against amyloid beta-peptide toxicity: evi-
dence for involvement of a kappa B-binding factor and attenuation 
of peroxide and Ca2+ accumulation. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. 
USA,1995, 92, 9328-9332. 

[100] Kaltschmidt, B.; Uherek, M.; Wellmann, H.; Volk, B.; 
Kaltschmidt, C. Inhibition of NF-kappaB potentiates amyloid beta-
mediated neuronal apoptosis. Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. USA, 1999, 96, 
9409-94014. 

[101] Sompol, P.; Xu, Y.; Ittarat, W.; Daosukho, C.; St Clair, D. NF-
kappaB-associated MnSOD induction protects against beta-
amyloid-induced neuronal apoptosis. J. Mol. Neurosci., 2006, 29, 
279-288. 

[102] Lezoualc'h, F.; Sagara, Y.; Holsboer, F.; Behl, C. High constitutive 
NF-kappaB activity mediates resistance to oxidative stress in neu-
ronal cells. J. Neurosci., 1998, 18, 3224-3232. 

[103] Martire, S.; Fuso, A.; Rotili, D.; Tempera, I.; Giordano, C.; De 
Zottis, I.; Muzi, A.; Vernole, P.; Graziani, G.; Lococo, E.; Faraldi, 
M.; Maras, B.; Scarpa, S.; Mosca, L.; d'Erme, M. PARP-1 modu-
lates amyloid beta peptide-induced neuronal damage. PLoS One., 
2013, 8, e72169. 

[104] Pogue, A.I.; Percy, M.E.; Cui, J.G.; Li, Y.Y.; Bhattacharjee, S.; 
Hill, J.M.; Kruck, T.P.; Zhao, Y.; Lukiw, W.J. Up-regulation of 
NF-kB-sensitive miRNA-125b and miRNA-146a in metal sulfate-
stressedhuman astroglial (HAG) primary cell cultures. J. Inorg. 
Biochem., 2011, 105, 1434-1437. 

[105] Couturier, J.; Paccalin, M.; Morel, M.; Terro, F.; Milin, S.; 
Pontcharraud, R.; Fauconneau, B.; Page, G. Prevention of the β-
amyloid peptide-induced inflammatory process by inhibition of 
double-stranded RNA-dependent protein kinase in primary murine 
mixed co-cultures. J. Neuroinflammation., 2011, 8, 72. doi: 
10.1186/1742-2094-8-72. 

[106] Chen, X-F.; Zhang, Y.W.; Xu, H.; Bu, G. Transcriptional regula-
tion and its misregulation in Alzheimer's disease. Mol. Brain., 
2013, 6, 44. doi: 10.1186/1756-6606-6-44. 

[107] Zheng, H.; Koo, E.H.The amyloid precursor protein: beyond amy-
loid. Mol. Neurodegener., 2006, 1, 5. doi: 10.1186/1750-1326-1-5. 

[108] La Fauci, G.; Lahiri, D.K.; Salton, S.R.; Robakis, N.K. Characteri-
zation of the 5'-end region and the first two exons of the beta-
protein precursor gene. Biochem. Biophys. Res. Commun., 1989 , 
159, 297-304. 

[109] Panegyres, P.K.; Atkins, E.R. The Functions of the Amyloid Pre-
cursor Protein Gene and Its Derivative Peptides: I Molecular Biol-
ogy and Metabolic Processing. Neurosci. Med., 2011, 2, 120-131. 

[110] Theuns, J.; Van Broeckhoven, C. Transcriptional regulation of 
Alzheimer's disease genes: implications for susceptibility. Hum. 
Mol. Genet., 2000, 9, 2383-2394. 

[111] Fukumoto, H.; Cheung, B.S.; Hyman, B.T.; Irizarry, M.C. β-
Secretase protein and activity are increased in the neocortex in 
Alzheimer disease. Arch. Neurol., 2002, 59, 1381-1389. 

[112] Li, R.; Lindholm, K.; Yang, L.B.; Yue, X.; Citron, M.; Yan, R.; 
Beach, T.; Sue, L.; Sabbagh, M.; Cai, H.; Wong, P.; Price, D.; 
Shen, Y. Amyloid beta peptide load is correlated with increased 
beta-secretase activity in sporadic Alzheimer's disease patients. 
Proc. Natl. Acad. Sci. USA, 2004, 101, 3632-3637. 

[113] Chami, L.; Checler, F. BACE1 is at the crossroad of a toxic vicious 
cycle involving cellular stress and β-amyloid production in Alz-
heimer's disease. Mol. Neurodegener.,2012, 7, 52. doi: 
10.1186/1750-1326-7-52. 

[114] Buggia-Prevot, V.; Sevalle, J.; Rossner, S.; Checler, F. NFkappaB-
dependent control of BACE1 promoter transactivation by Abeta42. 
J. Biol. Chem., 2008, 283, 10037-10047. 

[115] Chami, L.; Buggia-Prévot, V.; Duplan, E.; Delprete, D.; Chami, 
M.; Peyron, J.F.; Checler, F. Nuclear factor-κB regulates βAPP and 
β- and γ-secretases differently at physiological and supraphysi-
ological Aβ concentrations. J. Biol. Chem., 2012, 287, 24573-
24584. 

[116] Marwarha, G.; Raza, S.; Prasanthi, J.R.; Ghribi, O. Gadd153 and 
NF-κB crosstalk regulates 27-hydroxycholesterol-induced increase 
in BACE1 and β-amyloid production in human neuroblastoma SH-
SY5Y cells. PLoS One, 2013, 8, e70773. doi: 
10.1371/journal.pone.0070773. 

[117] Collister, K.A.; Albensi, B.C. Potential therapeutic targets in the 
NF-kappaB pathway for Alzheimer's disease. Drug News Perspect., 
2005, 18, 623-629. 

[118] Qin, Z.H.; Tao, L.Y.; Chen, X. Dual roles of NF-kappaB in cell 
survival and implications of NF-kappaB inhibitors in neuroprotec-
tive therapy. Acta Pharmacol. Sin., 2007, 28, 1859-1872. 

[119] Gilmore, T.D.; Herscovitch, M. Inhibitors of NF-κB signaling: 785 
and counting. Oncogene,2006, 25, 6887-6899. 

[120] Morris, M.C.; Evans, D.A.; Bienias, J.L.; Tangney, C.C.; Bennett, 
D.A.; Aggarwal, N.; Wilson, R.S.; Scherr, P.A. Dietary intake of 
antioxidant nutrients and the risk of incident Alzheimer disease in a 
biracial community study. JAMA, 2002, 287, 3230-3237. 

[121] Galasko, D.R.; Peskind, E.; Clark, C.M.; Quinn, J.F.; Ringman, 
J.M.; Jicha, G.A.; Cotman, C.; Cottrell, B.; Montine, T.J.; Thomas, 
R.G.; Aisen, P.; Alzheimer’s Disease Cooperative Study. Antioxi-
dants for Alzheimer disease: a randomized clinical trial with cere-
brospinal fluid biomarker measures. Arch. Neurol., 2012, 69, 836-
841. 

[122] Rothwell, N.; Allan, S.; Toulmond, S. The role of interleukin 1 in 
acute neurodegeneration and stroke: pathophysiological and thera-
peutic implications. J. Clin. Invest., 1997, 100, 2648-2652. 

[123] Tobinick, E. Perispinal etanercept for treatment of Alzheimer's 
disease. Curr. Alzheimer Res., 2007, 4, 550-552. 

[124] Tobinick, E.L.; Gross, H. Rapid cognitive improvement in Alz-
heimer's disease following perispinal etanercept administration. J. 
Neuroinflammation, 2008, 5, 2. 

[125] Mattson, M.P.;Camandola, S. NF-κB in neuronal plasticity and 
neurodegenerative disorders. J. Clin. Invest., 2001, 107, 247-254. 

[126] Valerio, A.; Boroni, F.; Benarese, M.; Sarnico, I.; Ghisi, V.; 
Bresciani, L.G.; Ferrario, M.; Borsani, G.; Spano, P.; Pizzi, M. NF-
kappaB pathway: a target for preventing beta-amyloid (Abeta)-
induced neuronal damage and Abeta42 production. Eur. J. 
Neurosci., 2006, 23, 1711-1720. 

[127] Yu, Y.; Zhou, L.; Sun, M.; Zhou, T.; Zhong, K.; Wang, H.; Liu, Y.; 
Liu, X.; Xiao, R.; Ge, J.; Tu, P.; Fan, D.S.; Lan, Y.; Hui, C.; Chui, 
D. Xylocoside G reduces amyloid-β induced neurotoxicity by in-

sasanka chakrabarti
Sticky Note
delete: stressedhuman
insert:    stressed human

sasanka chakrabarti
Sticky Note
Delete : The Functions of the Amyloid Precursor Protein Gene and Its Derivative Peptides: I Molecular Biology and Metabolic Processing.

Insert : The functions of the amyloid precursor protein gene and its derivative peptides: I  molecular biology and metabolic  processing.


 

sasanka chakrabarti
Highlight



Reactive Oxygen Species, Redox Signaling and Neuroinflammation Current Topics in Medicinal Chemistry, 2015, Vol. 15, No. 5    457 

hibiting NF-κB signaling pathway in neuronal cells. J. Alzheimers 
Dis.,2012, 30, 263-275. 

[128] Wang, S.; Yang, H.; Yu, L.; Jin, J.; Qian, L.; Zhao, H.; Xu, Y.; 
Zhu, X. Oridonin Attenuates Aβ1-42-Induced Neuroinflammation 
and Inhibits NF-κB Pathway. PLoS One, 2014, 9, e104745. doi: 
10.1371/journal.pone.0104745.  

[129] Choi, D.K.; Koppula, S.; Suk, K. Inhibitors of microglial neurotox-
icity: focus on natural products. Molecules, 2011, 16, 1021-1043. 

[130] Capiralla, H.; Vingtdeux, V.; Zhao, H.; Sankowski, R.; Al-Abed, 
Y.; Davies, P.; Marambaud, P. Resveratrol mitigates lipopolysac-
charide- and Aβ-mediated microglial inflammation by inhibiting 
the TLR4/NF-κB/STAT signaling cascade. J. Neurochem., 2012, 
120, 461-472. 

[131] Paris, D.; Patel, N.; Quadros, A.; Linan, M.; Bakshi, P.; Ait-
Ghezala, G.; Mullan, M. Inhibition of Abeta production by NF-
kappaB inhibitors. Neurosci. Lett.,2007, 415, 11-16. 

[132] Lee, J.W.; Lee, Y.K.; Ban, J.O.; Ha, T.Y.; Yun, Y.P.; Han, S.B.; 
Oh, K.W.; Hong, J.T. Green tea (-)-epigallocatechin-3-gallate in-
hibits beta-amyloid-induced cognitive dysfunction through modifi-
cation of secretase activity via inhibition of ERK and NF-kappaB 
pathways in mice. J. Nutr., 2009, 139, 1987-1993. 

[133] Nijboer, C.H.A.; Heijnen, C.J.; Groenendaal, F.; May, M.J.; van 
Bel, F.; Kavelaars, A. Strong neuroprotection by inhibition of NF-
κBafter neonatal hypoxia-ischemia involves apoptotic mechanisms 
but is independent of cytokines. Stroke, 2008, 39, 2129-2137. 

[134] Jatana, M.; Giri, S.; Ansari, M.A.; Elango, C.; Singh, A.K.; Singh, 
I.; Khan, M. Inhibition of NF-kappaB activation by 5-lipoxygenase 
inhibitors protects brain against injury in a rat model of focal cere-
bral ischemia. J. Neuroinflammation., 2006, 3, 12. doi:10.1186/ 
1742-2094-3-12. 

[135] Desai, A.; Singh, N.; Raghubir, R. Neuroprotective potential of the 
NF-κB inhibitor peptide IKK-NBD in cerebral ischemia-
reperfusion injury. Neurochem. Int., 2010, 57, 876-883. 

[136] Munoz, L.; Ammit, A.J. Targeting p38 MAPK pathway for the 
treatment of Alzheimer's disease. Neuropharmacology, 2010, 58, 
561-568. 

[137] Hensley, K.; Floyd, R.A.; Zheng, N.Y.; Nael, R.; Robinson, K.A.; 
Nguyen, X.; Pye, Q.N.; Stewart, C.A.; Geddes, J.; Markesbery, 
W.R. p38 kinase is activated in the Alzheimer's disease brain. J. 
Neurochem., 1999, 72, 2053-2058. 

[138] Munoz, L.; Ralay Ranaivo, H.; Roy, S.M.; Hu, W.; Craft, J.M.; 
McNamara, L.K.; Chico, L.W.; Van Eldik, L.J.; Watterson, D.M. A 
novel p38 alpha MAPK inhibitor suppresses brain proinflammatory 
cytokine up-regulation and attenuates synaptic dysfunction and be-
havioral deficits in an Alzheimer's disease mouse model. J. 
Neuroinflammation., 2007, 4, 21. doi:10.1186/1742-2094-4-21. 

[139] Lukiw, W.J. Antagonism of NF-κB-up-regulated micro RNAs 
(miRNAs) in sporadic Alzheimer's disease (AD)-anti-NF-κB vs. 
anti-miRNA strategies. Front. Genet., 2013, 4, 77. doi: 
10.3389/fgene.2013.00077.  

 
 
 

Received: ???????????????? Revised: ???????????????? Accepted: ???????????????? 

 
 


	Reactive Oxygen Species - TP
	CTMC final (1)

